
 

                      

 
SOTI MobiControl Software Now Available for  
CipherLab Windows®-based Mobile Computers  

 
Taipei, Taiwan — March 9, 2009 — CipherLab, a leading innovator in Automated Identification and 
Data Capture for the retail, warehouse and distribution markets, and SOTI Inc., developer of mobile 
device management/advanced security and support software, today announced the release of SOTI’s 
MobiControl for CipherLab’s 9400 and 9500 series mobile computers.   
 
SOTI MobiControl enables users to access a robust set of features including software provisioning, 
remote control/helpdesk toolset functionality, screen capture, remote device diagnostics, file transfer 
and advanced security. These core features allow IT teams to manage and support their mobile 
workers more effectively and efficiently without requiring a central depot for their mobile devices. 

 
The powerful and user-friendly 9400 and 9500 series mobile computers deliver features such as 
built-in digital camera, multi-form data input, multi-scanning options, and the ability to read and write 
RFID tags. They lead the industry with up to eight hours of battery life in WLAN mode, and surpass 
drop impact standards–important considerations for demanding conditions of the warehouse or 
field-use environments. Supported by SOTI’s MobiControl software, the 9400 and 9500 series offer 
customers a complete mobile computer solution that quickly and economically meets the mobile 
worker’s needs. 
 
About CipherLab 
CipherLab is a global leader in the design, manufacture, and marketing of Automatic Identification 
and Data Capture/Collection products and systems. The company’s mobile CIPHERLAB CO., LTD. 
computers and scanners are integrated into the networks of some of the world's best known logistics, 
retail, distribution, government installations and healthcare companies, helping them run more 
efficiently and effectively onsite and on the road. Operating worldwide, CipherLab is headquartered in 
Taipei, Taiwan with offices in China, Germany, the United Kingdom and the USA and is publicly 
traded on the Taiwan stock exchange (Taiwan OTC: 6160). For more information, please visit 
http://www.cipherlab.com. 
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About SOTI Inc.  

SOTI Inc. develops industry leading technology that solves the unique challenges involved in 
deploying, managing, securing and supporting remote mobile and desktop computing devices. Today 
over 75,000 customers around the world in retail, manufacturing, health care, government, logistics 
and other industries rely on SOTI products to reduce their costs associated with supporting a mobile 
field force.  

MobiControl is a next generation Mobile Device Management, Security and Support solution that is 
built using SOTI’s world class Award Winning Technology. Whether you are using consumer based 
devices for push email or rugged devices in the field, MobiControl is the solution of choice for rapid 
and reliable performance over any network for any size of deployment.  

Visit us at www.soti.net to download a fully functional evaluation version of MobiControl V6 today. 
Explore MobiControl’s new Security Center, which allows you to set Policies for User Authentication, 
Device Lockdown, Virus / Malware protection through Application Run Control, File Encryption, 
Device Feature Control and more! 


