
 

 

KALIPSO Mobile Application Generator Now Available 
for CipherLab Windows® Mobile Computers 

Easy, Fast, and Intuitive for Cost-Effective Application Generation, Database 
Synchronization, and Mobile Terminal Management 

 

Taipei, Taiwan – 31st, August, 2011 – CipherLab, a leading innovator in Automated 
Identification and Data Capture (AIDC) for the retail, warehouse, and distribution industries, 
today announced the availability of KALIPSO Mobile Application Generator for its mobile 
computers supported by Windows® operating systems. This third-party application generator 
software provides an easy and intuitive platform for users to create and manage applications 
with drag and drop, either online or offline. 
 
“Our primary focus has always been empowering our customers with enhanced functionality 
that fits their unique needs, whether for the hardware or software we provide”, explained 
Sherman Chuang, President of CipherLab. “With KALIPSO, we provide a one-stop service, 
customizing programs into our Windows® mobile computers easily. We believe this will help 
corporates invest their time and money with better return.” 
 
For businesses looking for solutions to power up their workflow management and cut down 
the efforts for device customization, KALIPSO is currently available for the newly launched 
CP30, and also 9300 & 9600 mobile computers. To help users get started right away, 
CipherLab has developed three demo programs upon the purchase of the device. Users can 
utilize the editable application templates to perform inventory check, order entry, and 
proof-of-delivery tasks. 
 
For more details regarding KALIPSO Mobile Application Generator and other CipherLab 
products, please visit www.cipherlab.com. 
 
About Sysdev 
Sysdev provides a rapid development platform for Windows environments, named Kalipso, 
with special focus on the area of operational mobility. Incorporating modules in their tools 
like online and offline communication, Barcode and RFID (between many other 
technologies), this platform allows partners to, in a quick and easy way, create applications 
for professional mobile environments. With Headquarters in Ílhavo, Portugal, SYSDEV is a 



recognized player in this domain. For more information about Sysdev, visit its website at 
www.sysdevsolutions.com. 
 

About CipherLab 

CipherLab is a global leader in the design, manufacture, and marketing of Automatic 
Identification and Data Capture/Collection products and systems. The company’s mobile 
computers and scanners are integrated into the networks of some of the world's best known 
logistics, retail, distribution, government installations and healthcare companies, helping 
them run more efficiently and effectively onsite and on the road. Operating worldwide, 
CipherLab is headquartered in Taipei, Taiwan with offices in China, Germany and the USA, 
and is publicly traded on the Taiwan stock exchange (Taiwan OTC: 6160). For more 
information, please visit www.cipherlab.com. 
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